

**READY MIX CONCRETE AND FLOWABLE FILL
 BID OPENING - FEBRUARY 19, 2020**

CONCRETE DELIVERED - PRICE PER CUBIC YARD:

	<u>HANSON AGG.</u>	<u>LITTLE LISA DBA WAYNE CONCRETE</u>	<u>SPALLINA MATERIALS</u>
<u>NORTHEAST QUADRANT</u>			
CONCRETE CLASS: A	\$175.00	No Bid	\$174.00
CONCRETE CLASS: D	\$177.00		\$180.00
CONCRETE CLASS: E	\$177.00		\$176.00
CONCRETE CLASS: F	\$177.00		\$181.00
<u>NORTHWEST QUADRANT</u>			
CONCRETE CLASS: A	\$175.00	No Bid	No Bid
CONCRETE CLASS: D	\$177.00		
CONCRETE CLASS: E	\$177.00		
CONCRETE CLASS: F	\$177.00		
<u>SOUTHEAST QUADRANT</u>			
CONCRETE CLASS: A	\$160.00	\$152.50	No Bid
CONCRETE CLASS: D	\$165.00	\$157.00	
CONCRETE CLASS: E	\$165.00	\$156.00	
CONCRETE CLASS: F	\$166.00	\$157.75	
<u>SOUTHWEST QUADRANT</u>			
CONCRETE CLASS: A	\$160.00	\$151.50	No Bid
CONCRETE CLASS: D	\$165.00	\$156.50	
CONCRETE CLASS: E	\$165.00	\$155.50	
CONCRETE CLASS: F	\$166.00	\$157.00	
FIBER MESH ADDITIVE PRICE ADDITIONAL PER CUBIC YARD	\$12.00	\$10.00	10.25
ADMIXTURES - ADDITIONAL PER CUBIC YARD			
ASTM TYPE A	\$6.25	\$2.50	\$6.50
ASTM TYPE D	\$4.25	\$5.25	\$4.50
ASTM TYPE F	\$7.25	\$8.50	\$7.50
<u>ADDITIONAL CHARGES</u>			
	*less 5 CY		
SMALL LOAD CHARGE	\$75.00	\$80.00	\$80.00
HEATED LOAD CHARGE	\$12.00	\$12.00	\$11.50
Months heated load applies	11/15 to 04/15	11/15 to 04/15	11/15 to 04/15

READY MIX CONCRETE AND FLOWABLE FILL**FLOWABLE FILL - PRICES PER CUBIC YARD**

	<u>HANSON AGG.</u>	<u>LITTLE LISA WAYNE CONCRETE</u>
<u>NORTHEAST QUADRANT</u>		
CLSM TYPE "A"	\$140.00	No Bid
CLSM TYPE "B"	\$135.00	
CLSM TYPE "C"	\$137.00	
CONTROLLED DENSITY FILL	\$125.00	
<u>NORTHWEST QUADRANT</u>		
CLSM TYPE "A"	\$140.00	No Bid
CLSM TYPE "B"	\$135.00	
CLSM TYPE "C"	\$137.00	
CONTROLLED DENSITY FILL	\$125.00	
<u>SOUTHEAST QUADRANT</u>		
CLSM TYPE "A"	\$140.00	\$130.00
CLSM TYPE "B"	\$135.00	\$127.75
CLSM TYPE "C"	\$137.00	\$129.50
CONTROLLED DENSITY FILL	\$125.00	No Bid
<u>SOUTHWEST QUADRANT</u>		
CLSM TYPE "A"	\$140.00	\$129.00
CLSM TYPE "B"	\$135.00	\$126.75
CLSM TYPE "C"	\$137.00	\$128.50
CONTROLLED DENSITY FILL	\$125.00	No Bid
<u>ADDITIONAL CHARGES</u>		
	*less 5 CY	
SMALL LOAD CHARGE	\$75.00	\$80.00
HEATED LOAD CHARGE	\$12.00	\$12.00
Months heated load applies	11/15 to 04/15	11/15 to 04/15

Bid spec states
Small load - less than 3 cubic yards

* Note
NYS DOT will be in
this Spring to
Re-Approve the
Plant & Mixer Trucks

All bids are subject to final review and acceptance by the Public Works Committee of the Allegany County Legislature before any award may be made.