

**LIQUID BITUMINOUS MATERIALS
 BID OPENING FEBRUARY 19, 2020**

<u>LIQUID BITUMINOUS MATERIALS</u>		SUIT-KOTE	MIDLAND ASPHALT	VESTAL ASPHALT	SPALLINA MTLS
Delivered and Applied					
<u>NYS DESIGNATIONS</u>	<u>GRADE</u>	<u>BID PRICE PER GALLON</u>	<u>BID PRICE PER GALLON</u>	<u>BID PRICE PER GALLON</u>	<u>BID PRICE PER GALLON</u>
APPLIED - ANIONIC EMULSIONS					
702.20	MC-30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
702.3001	RS-1	\$2.805	\$2.825	\$2.930	
703.3101	RS-2	\$2.895	\$2.915	\$3.038	
702.3102	HFRS-2	\$2.895	\$2.915	\$3.038	
702.3201	MS-2	\$3.254	\$3.274	\$3.410	
702.3301	HFMS-2	\$3.254	\$3.274	\$3.410	
702.3401	HFMS-2H	\$3.254	\$3.274	\$3.410	
702.3701	HFRS-2P	\$3.155	\$3.175	\$3.298	
702.3801	RS-2P	\$3.155	\$3.175	\$3.298	
<u>APPLIED - CATIONIC EMULSIONS</u>					
702-4201	CMS-2	\$3.274	\$3.254	\$3.390	
702-4101	CRS-2	\$2.915	\$2.895	\$3.018	
702-4702	CRS-2P	\$3.175	\$3.155	\$3.278	
ASPHALT EMULSION DUST CONTROL	AEDC	\$2.250	\$1.850	\$2.350	
Tack Coat					
702-90	Dilute Tack Coat	\$5.80	\$9.00	\$10.00	\$4.75
Distributor Rate	\$150.00 per hour				

<u>LIQUID BITUMINOUS MATERIALS - Cont.</u>	SUIT-KOTE	MIDLAND ASPHALT	VESTAL ASPHALT	UNIQUE PAVING
MIXING GRADES (ANIONIC & CATIONIC EMULSIONS)	<u>BID PRICE PER GALLON</u>	<u>BID PRICE PER GALLON</u>	<u>BID PRICE PER GALLON</u>	<u>BID PRICE PER GALLON</u>
ITEM : 702-3201	MS-2			
TRAVEL MIX PAVER	\$3.544	\$3.564	\$3.700	
PUG MILL & PAVER	\$3.844	\$3.874	\$4.000	
PUG MILL ONLY	\$3.524	\$3.544	\$3.680	
ITEM: 702-3301	HFMS-2			
TRAVEL MIX PAVER	\$3.544	\$3.564	\$3.774	
PUG MILL & PAVER	\$3.844	\$3.874	\$4.074	
PUG MILL ONLY	\$3.524	\$3.544	\$3.754	
ITEM: 702-4201	CMS-2			
TRAVEL MIX PAVER	\$3.564	\$3.544	\$3.700	
PUG MILL & PAVER	\$3.864	\$3.854	\$4.000	
PUG MILL ONLY	\$3.544	\$3.524	\$3.680	
	HFMS-2GH			
TRAVEL MIX PAVER	\$3.614	\$3.648	\$3.774	
PUG MILL & PAVER	\$3.914	\$3.958	\$4.074	
PUG MILL ONLY	\$3.594	\$3.628	\$3.754	
COLD PATCH OIL				
Mod. MCS-2	\$3.414	\$3.650	\$3.540	
HFMS-2S	\$3.384	\$3.670	\$3.540	
Hyperpatch Oil	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.350	\$5.390

Price includes
Liquid Blend
Pugmill Operator
& Freight

PAVER PLACED SURFACE TREATMENT

Bid Price Per Square Yard	SUIT-KOTE	MIDLAND ASPHALT
TYPE A- 1/4 INCH	No Bid	
UP TO 5000 S.Y.		\$7.54
5000 TO 15000 S.Y.		\$5.91
15001 TO 30000 S.Y.		\$5.54
30001 S.Y. PLUS		\$5.45
TYPE B - 3/8 INCH	No Bid	
UP TO 5000 S.Y.		\$7.50
5000 TO 15000 S.Y.		\$5.87
15001 TO 30000 S.Y.		\$5.50
30001 S.Y. PLUS		\$5.40
TYPE C - 1/2 INCH	No Bid	
UP TO 5000 S.Y.		\$7.50
5000 TO 15000 S.Y.		\$5.87
15001 TO 30000 S.Y.		\$5.50
30001 S.Y. PLUS		\$5.40

ALLOWABLE DEDUCTIONS - per square yard if Contracting Agency elects to supplement operation with their equipment and labor

DEDUCT FOR COMPACTION EQUIPMENT	\$0.05
DEDUCT FOR HAULING	\$0.20
DEDUCT IF CONTRACTING AGENCY FURNISHES TRAFFIC CONTROL	\$0.20

PAVER PLACED SURFACE TREATMENT - IN PLACE SPECIFIED

Bid Price Per Square Yard	SUIT-KOTE	MIDLAND ASPHALT
CR35 - ENTIRE LENGTH	No Bid	
8,200 S.Y. +/-		
TYPE A- 1/4 INCH		No Bid
TYPE B - 3/8 INCH		\$5.82
TYPE C - 1/2 INCH		\$5.82

ALLOWABLE DEDUCTIONS - per square yard if Contracting Agency elects to supplement operation with their equipment and labor

DEDUCT FOR COMPACTION EQUIPMENT	\$0.05
DEDUCT FOR HAULING	\$0.20
DEDUCT IF CONTRACTING AGENCY FURNISHES TRAFFIC CONTROL	\$0.20

TYPE 6 DENSE GRADED COLD MIX COURSE AND BITUMINOUS SEAL COAT - IN PLACE

	SUIT-KOTE	MIDLAND ASPHALT
TYPE 6 DENSE GRADED COLD MIX IN PLACE		
PER TON	\$63.220	\$72.83
BITUMINOUS SEAL COAT IN PLACE		
PER SQ. YD	\$0.427	\$0.4300
ITEM 702-3301 HFMS-2 IN PLACE		
PER GALLON	\$3.254	\$3.2740

TOTAL COST PER SQ YD

TYPE 6 DENSE GRADED COLD MIX		
PRICE PER TON	\$63.220	\$72.83
PRICE PER TON X 2000 LB/220/LB/SQ YD	\$6.950	\$8.0110
SEAL COAT PRICE PER SQ. YD	\$0.427	\$0.4300
PRICE PER GALLON	\$3.254	\$3.2740
PRICE PER GALLON X .35 GAL/SQ YD	\$1.139	\$1.1460
TOTAL COST PER SQUARE YD	\$8.516	\$9.5870

BID SHEET - FIBER REINFORCED BITUMINOUS MEMBRANE SURFACE TREATMENT

The undersigned bidder has carefully examined the specification for FIBER REINFORCED BITUMINOUS MEMBRANE SURFACE TREATMENT and agrees to furnish and supply all the materials, equipment, tools and labor necessary to properly install the product requested, in strict conformance to the detailed specification attached. No deviations, amendments, or alternative methods of application or installation of the product or specification will be considered.

Bidders are requested to submit prices per square yard for the two (2) types listed and Options A - F. The square yard range is the average daily square yards to be constructed on all project locations or work sites

<u>SQUARE YARD RANGE</u>	<u>FiberMat Type A</u>	<u>FiberMat Type B</u>	<u>Option A</u>	<u>Option B</u>	<u>Option C</u>	<u>Option D</u>	<u>Option E</u>	<u>Option F</u>
1 - 5,000 SY/Day	\$ 3.41 /SY	\$ 3.36 /SY	\$.28 /SY	\$.37 /SY	\$.36 /SY	\$.34 /SY	\$.36 /SY	\$.36 /SY
5,001 - 10,000 SY/Day	\$ 2.84 /SY	\$ 2.79 /SY	\$.28 /SY	\$.185 /SY	\$.175 /SY	\$.18 /SY	\$.175 /SY	\$.175 /SY
10,001 - 20,000 SY/Day	\$ 2.22 /SY	\$ 2.17 /SY	\$.28 /SY	\$.10 /SY	\$.09 /SY	\$.145 /SY	\$.095 /SY	\$.095 /SY
20,001 - 40,000 SY/Day	\$ 2.02 /SY	\$ 1.97 /SY	\$.28 /SY	\$.05 /SY	\$.05 /SY	\$.095 /SY	\$.045 /SY	\$.05 /SY
40,001+ SY/Day	\$ 1.91 /SY	\$ 1.86 /SY	\$.28 /SY	\$.05 /SY	\$.04 /SY	\$.09 /SY	\$.04 /SY	\$.04 /SY

OPTIONAL ADDITIONAL ITEMS (if Agency elects to require Contractor to provide any or all of these items)

- A. If Contractor furnishes and delivers aggregate to aggregate Chip Spreader
- B. If Contractor furnishes and operates self-propelled aggregate Chip Spreader
- C. If Contractor furnishes and operates pneumatic tired roller (per roller)
- D. If Contractor furnishes Maintenance & Protection of Traffic as per MUTCD
- E. If Contractor furnishes and operates steel wheel roller (per roller)
- F. If Contractor furnishes and operates self-propelled broom or vacuum sweeper

NAME OF COMPANY BIDDING: MIDLAND ASPHALT MATERIALS INC.

All bids are subject to final review and acceptance by the Public Works Committee of the Allegany County Legislature before any award may be made.