

**Bid Opening- September 17, 2020
2020-2021 Sand Salt Hauling**

SUPPLIER: NEW ENTERPRISE STONE - Alfred

TOWNS	TONS	B&R Green	Leon Lacy
		Trucking	
ALLEN	1400	\$5.15	No Bid
ALMA	1100	\$4.75	No Bid
AMITY	500	\$3.25	No Bid
ANDOVER	3100	\$2.50	\$2.20
ANGELICA	2000	\$3.45	No Bid
BELFAST	1700	\$4.84	No Bid
BIRDSALL	1300	\$4.70	\$4.30
BOLIVAR	1600	\$5.49	No Bid
BURNS	1400	\$3.34	\$3.27
CANEADEA	900	\$4.84	No Bid
CUBA	2600	\$5.35	No Bid
FRIENDSHIP	2600	\$4.50	No Bid
GENESEE	1700	\$5.74	No Bid
GRANGER	2250	\$5.15	No Bid
GROVE	2000	\$4.40	\$4.20
INDEPENDENCE	1500	\$4.30	No Bid
NEW HUDSON	600	\$5.85	No Bid
SCIO	2500	\$3.40	No Bid
WARD	1100	\$2.75	No Bid
WELLSVILLE	1900	\$3.50	No Bid
WEST ALMOND	3000	\$2.85	\$2.46
WILLING	1000	\$4.34	No Bid
WIRT	3000	\$5.40	No Bid
CR 48 STOCKPILE	3500	\$3.50	No Bid
SUPPLIER: GERNATT ASPHALT			
CENTERVILLE	3000	\$4.34	No Bid
HUME	1800	\$5.00	No Bid
RUSHFORD	2500	\$4.34	No Bid

**All bids are subject to final review and acceptance by the Public Works
Committee of the Allegany County Legislature before any award may be made.**