

**ASPHALT CONCRETE  
MISCELLANEOUS IN PLACE  
BID OPENING - FEBRUARY 19, 2020**

**BIDDER  
Dolomite Products  
dba AL Blades**

**BIDDER  
Spallina  
Materials**

<b>LOCATION</b>	<b>QUANTITY IN TONS</b>
<b>Northeast Quadrant</b>	<150
	151-500
	>500
<b>Northwest Quadrant</b>	<150
	151-500
	>500
<b>Southeast Quadrant</b>	<150
	151-500
	>500
<b>Southwest Quadrant</b>	<150
	151-500
	>500

<b>IN-PLACE BID PER TON</b>
\$220.00
\$115.00
\$98.50
\$220.00
\$117.50
\$101.00
\$220.00
\$115.00
\$98.50
\$220.00
\$117.50
\$101.00

<b>IN-PLACE BID PER TON</b>
\$230.00
\$145.00
\$99.00
\$235.00
\$149.00
\$101.50
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

All bids are subject to final review and acceptance by the Public Works Committee of the Allegany County Legislature before any award may be made.