

Bid Tabulation
Hauling 5:1 Sand Salt Mixture
September 22, 2021

SUPPLIER: NEW ENTERPRISE STONE - Alfred

Deliver to:	Tons	B&R	D&H	Leon Lacy	Zoladz	Award
Allen	1400	\$5.05	\$5.20	\$5.20	No Bid	No Award
Alma	1100	\$4.64	\$5.50	\$4.95	No Bid	B&R
Amity	500	\$3.19	\$3.95	\$3.20	No Bid	No Award
Andover	2700	\$2.20	\$3.10	\$2.40	No Bid	No Award
Angelica	1800	\$3.35	\$4.15	\$3.60	No Bid	B&R
Belfast	1700	\$4.64	\$4.75	\$4.75	No Bid	B&R
Birdsall	1300	\$4.25	\$4.65	\$4.50	No Bid	B&R
Bolivar	1500	\$5.38	\$5.50	\$5.50	No Bid	B&R
Burns	1200	\$3.24	\$4.20	\$3.30	No Bid	No Award
Caneadea	800	\$4.79	\$5.05	\$4.85	No Bid	B&R
Cuba	2500	\$5.28	\$5.30	\$5.30	No Bid	B&R
Friendship	2300	\$4.50	\$5.00	\$4.35	No Bid	No Award
Genesee	1500	\$5.64	\$6.75	\$5.80	No Bid	B&R
Granger	1800	\$5.05	\$6.15	\$5.20	No Bid	No Award
Grover	1800	\$4.10	\$4.80	\$4.25	No Bid	No Award
Independence	1500	\$4.19	\$4.40	\$4.15	No Bid	No Award
New Hudson	500	\$5.80	\$5.90	\$5.80	No Bid	No Award
Scio	2100	\$3.29	\$3.85	\$3.45	No Bid	No Award
Ward	1000	\$2.75	\$3.20	\$2.75	No Bid	No Award
Wellsville	1700	\$3.40	\$4.25	\$3.53	No Bid	B&R
West Almond	3000	\$2.45	\$3.55	\$2.60	No Bid	B&R
Willing	1000	\$4.19	\$4.65	\$4.35	No Bid	B&R
Wirt	2800	\$5.34	\$5.50	\$5.25	No Bid	Leon Lacy

SUPPLIER: GERNATT ASPHALT

Deliver to:	Tons	B&R	D&H	Leon Lacy	Zoladz	Award
Centerville	2400	\$4.55	\$4.40	\$4.40	\$11.00	Leon Lacy
Hume	1600	\$5.25	\$6.00	\$5.05	\$11.00	Leon Lacy
Rushford	2200	\$4.55	\$4.40	\$4.35	\$11.00	Leon Lacy